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Slattery, Elizabeth (Federal)

From: hilary geary < >
Sent: Tuesday, March 27, 2018 4:37 PM
To: Gail Victor
Cc: NetJets Contracts - Central; Wilbur Ross; Leach, Macie (Federal); Cory Valentine; Brenda Smith
Subject: Re: NetJets Closing Notice - Wilbur Ross

Thanks  

Sent from my iPhone 
Hilary Geary Ross 

 
 
 
On Mar 27, 2018, at 4:28 PM, Gail Victor <gvictor@netjets.com> wrote: 

Dear Hilary, 
We’re going to adjust  

 
  We’ll also send you an invoice for the amount due. 

  
Best regards, 
  
  
  
Gail C Victor 
Vice President, Owner Accounts 
NetJets Inc. 
 
T: (212) 499‐3768 
C:   
F: (212)499‐3710 
E: gvictor@netjets.com 
www.netjets.com  
NetJets® Inc. is a Berkshire Hathaway company. 
  

From: hilary geary [mailto ]  
Sent: Tuesday, March 27, 2018 4:10 PM 
To: NetJets Contracts ‐ Central <Contracts.Central@netjets.com> 
Cc: Wilbur Ross < >; Macie Leach <SLeach@doc.gov>; Gail Victor 
<gvictor@netjets.com>; Cory Valentine <cvalentine@netjets.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: NetJets Closing Notice ‐ Wilbur Ross 
  

********************************  
This message originated from outside of NetJets. Please use caution when clicking on any links or 
attachments.  
********************************  
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Thanks! And I would like to   . How does that work ?   
Best   
Hilary Geary Ross 

 
  
 
On Mar 27, 2018, at 4:07 PM, NetJets Contracts ‐ Central <Contracts.Central@netjets.com> wrote: 

Good Afternoon 
  
In Laura’s absence, I would like to inform you that the Lease   

closed and the appropriate documents have been filed 
with the FAA.  The official closing date is March 27, 2018.  The   

 
and the first invoice will be mailed shortly. 

  
Please do not hesitate to contact me should you have any questions regarding this 
information or if I can be of further assistance. 
  
Thank you for your continued confidence in the NetJets® Program. 
  
Best Regards, 
  

Heather Griffith 
Contracts Administrator 
  
E. contracts.central@netjets.com 

T. 614-239-3675 

F. 614-239-6081 

netjets.com  
  
<image001.png> 
  
NetJets® Inc. 
4151 Bridgeway Avenue 
Columbus OH 43219 

00 0 00  
  
Discover the Signature Series, the customized range of aircraft exclusive to NetJets. 
  
NetJets® Inc. is a Berkshire Hathaway Company. 
  

 
*** *** *** 
This message contains information which may be confidential and privileged. Unless you 
are the addressee (or authorized to receive for the addressee), you may not use, copy or 
disclose to anyone the message or any information contained in the message. If you 
have received the message in error,  please advise the sender by reply e‐mail and delete 
the message. 

 

**** **** **** ****  
This message contains information which may be confidential and privileged. Unless you are the 
addressee (or authorized to receive for the addressee), you may not use, copy or disclose to anyone the 
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message or any information contained in the message. If you have received the message in error, please 
advise the sender by reply e‐mail and delete the message.  
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Slattery, Elizabeth (Federal)

From: Gail Victor <gvictor@netjets.com>
Sent: Tuesday, March 27, 2018 4:28 PM
To: hilary geary; NetJets Contracts - Central
Cc: Wilbur Ross; Leach, Macie (Federal); Cory Valentine; Brenda Smith
Subject: RE: Re: NetJets Closing Notice - Wilbur Ross

Dear Hilary, 
We’re going to adjust  

 
   We’ll also send you an invoice for the 

amount due. 
 
Best regards, 
 
 
 
Gail C Victor 
Vice President, Owner Accounts 
NetJets Inc. 
 
T: (212) 499‐3768 
C:   
F: (212)499‐3710 
E: gvictor@netjets.com 
www.netjets.com  
NetJets® Inc. is a Berkshire Hathaway company. 
 

From: hilary geary [mailto ]  
Sent: Tuesday, March 27, 2018 4:10 PM 
To: NetJets Contracts ‐ Central <Contracts.Central@netjets.com> 
Cc: Wilbur Ross < >; Macie Leach <SLeach@doc.gov>; Gail Victor <gvictor@netjets.com>; Cory 
Valentine <cvalentine@netjets.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: NetJets Closing Notice ‐ Wilbur Ross 
 

********************************  
This message originated from outside of NetJets. Please use caution when clicking on any links or attachments.  
********************************  

Thanks! And I would like to   How does that work ?   
Best   
Hilary Geary Ross 

 
 
 
On Mar 27, 2018, at 4:07 PM, NetJets Contracts ‐ Central <Contracts.Central@netjets.com> wrote: 

Good Afternoon 
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In Laura’s absence, I would like to inform you that the Lease   

closed and the appropriate documents have been filed with the FAA.  The official closing 
date is March 27, 2018.  The   

 and the first invoice will be mailed shortly. 
  
Please do not hesitate to contact me should you have any questions regarding this information or if I can 
be of further assistance. 
  
Thank you for your continued confidence in the NetJets® Program. 
  
Best Regards, 
  

Heather Griffith 
Contracts Administrator 
  
E. contracts.central@netjets.com 

T. 614-239-3675 

F. 614-239-6081 

netjets.com  
  
<image001.png> 
  
NetJets® Inc. 
4151 Bridgeway Avenue 
Columbus OH 43219 

00 0 00  
  
Discover the Signature Series, the customized range of aircraft exclusive to NetJets. 
  
NetJets® Inc. is a Berkshire Hathaway Company. 
  

 
*** *** *** 
This message contains information which may be confidential and privileged. Unless you are the 
addressee (or authorized to receive for the addressee), you may not use, copy or disclose to anyone the 
message or any information contained in the message. If you have received the message in 
error,  please advise the sender by reply e‐mail and delete the message. 

 

**** **** **** ****  
This message contains information which may be confidential and privileged. Unless you are the addressee (or 
authorized to receive for the addressee), you may not use, copy or disclose to anyone the message or any information 
contained in the message. If you have received the message in error, please advise the sender by reply e‐mail and delete 
the message.  
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Slattery, Elizabeth (Federal)

From: NetJets Contracts - Central <Contracts.Central@netjets.com>
Sent: Tuesday, March 27, 2018 4:17 PM
To: hilary geary
Cc: Wilbur Ross; Leach, Macie (Federal); Gail Victor; Cory Valentine; NetJets Contracts - Central
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Re: NetJets Closing Notice - Wilbur Ross

Hilary, 
 
Cory or Gail will be able to assist you in coordinating setting up  . 
 
Best Regards, 
 

Heather Griffith 
Contracts Administrator 
  
E. contracts.central@netjets.com 

T. 614-239-3675 

F. 614-239-6081 

netjets.com  
  

 
 

From: hilary geary [mailto ]  
Sent: Tuesday, March 27, 2018 4:10 PM 
To: NetJets Contracts ‐ Central <Contracts.Central@netjets.com> 
Cc: Wilbur Ross < >; Macie Leach <SLeach@doc.gov>; Gail Victor <gvictor@netjets.com>; Cory 
Valentine <cvalentine@netjets.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: NetJets Closing Notice ‐ Wilbur Ross 
 

********************************  
This message originated from outside of NetJets. Please use caution when clicking on any links or attachments.  
********************************  

Thanks! And I would like to   How does that work ?   
Best   
Hilary Geary Ross 

 
 
 
On Mar 27, 2018, at 4:07 PM, NetJets Contracts ‐ Central <Contracts.Central@netjets.com> wrote: 

Good Afternoon 
  
In Laura’s absence, I would like to inform you that the Lease   

 closed and the appropriate documents have been filed with the FAA.  The official closing 
date is March 27, 2018.  The   

 and the first invoice will be mailed shortly. 
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Please do not hesitate to contact me should you have any questions regarding this information or if I can 
be of further assistance. 
  
Thank you for your continued confidence in the NetJets® Program. 
  
Best Regards, 
  

Heather Griffith 
Contracts Administrator 
  
E. contracts.central@netjets.com 

T. 614-239-3675 

F. 614-239-6081 

netjets.com  
  
<image001.png> 
  
NetJets® Inc. 
4151 Bridgeway Avenue 
Columbus OH 43219 

00 0 00  
  
Discover the Signature Series, the customized range of aircraft exclusive to NetJets. 
  
NetJets® Inc. is a Berkshire Hathaway Company. 
  

 
*** *** *** 
This message contains information which may be confidential and privileged. Unless you are the 
addressee (or authorized to receive for the addressee), you may not use, copy or disclose to anyone the 
message or any information contained in the message. If you have received the message in 
error,  please advise the sender by reply e‐mail and delete the message. 

 
*** *** *** 
This message contains information which may be confidential and privileged. Unless you are the addressee (or 
authorized to receive for the addressee), you may not use, copy or disclose to anyone the message or any information 
contained in the message. If you have received the message in error,  please advise the sender by reply e‐mail and 
delete the message. 



115

Slattery, Elizabeth (Federal)

From: hilary geary < >
Sent: Tuesday, March 27, 2018 4:10 PM
To: NetJets Contracts - Central
Cc: Wilbur Ross; Leach, Macie (Federal); Gail Victor; Cory Valentine
Subject: Re: NetJets Closing Notice - Wilbur Ross

Thanks! And I would like to   . How does that work ?  
Best  
Hilary Geary Ross 

 
 
 
On Mar 27, 2018, at 4:07 PM, NetJets Contracts ‐ Central <Contracts.Central@netjets.com> wrote: 

Good Afternoon 
  
In Laura’s absence, I would like to inform you that the Lease Increase   

closed and the appropriate documents have been filed with the FAA.  The official closing 
date is March 27, 2018.  The   

 and the first invoice will be mailed shortly. 
  
Please do not hesitate to contact me should you have any questions regarding this information or if I can 
be of further assistance. 
  
Thank you for your continued confidence in the NetJets® Program. 
  
Best Regards, 
  

Heather Griffith 
Contracts Administrator 
  
E. contracts.central@netjets.com 

T. 614-239-3675 

F. 614-239-6081 

netjets.com  
  
<image001.png> 
  
NetJets® Inc. 
4151 Bridgeway Avenue 
Columbus OH 43219 

00 0 00  
  
Discover the Signature Series, the customized range of aircraft exclusive to NetJets. 
  
NetJets® Inc. is a Berkshire Hathaway Company. 
  

 
*** *** *** 
This message contains information which may be confidential and privileged. Unless you are the 
addressee (or authorized to receive for the addressee), you may not use, copy or disclose to anyone the 
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message or any information contained in the message. If you have received the message in 
error,  please advise the sender by reply e‐mail and delete the message. 
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Slattery, Elizabeth (Federal)

From: NetJets Contracts - Central <Contracts.Central@netjets.com>
Sent: Tuesday, March 27, 2018 4:07 PM
To: hilary geary
Cc: Wilbur Ross; Leach, Macie (Federal); Gail Victor; NetJets Contracts - Central; Cory Valentine
Subject: NetJets Closing Notice - Wilbur Ross

Good Afternoon 
 
In Laura’s absence, I would like to inform you that the Lease   
closed and the appropriate documents have been filed with the FAA.  The official closing date is March 27, 2018.  The 

 
and the first invoice will be mailed shortly. 

 
Please do not hesitate to contact me should you have any questions regarding this information or if I can be of further 
assistance. 
 
Thank you for your continued confidence in the NetJets® Program. 
 
Best Regards, 
 

Heather Griffith 
Contracts Administrator 
  
E. contracts.central@netjets.com 

T. 614-239-3675 

F. 614-239-6081 

netjets.com  
  

 
  
NetJets® Inc. 
4151 Bridgeway Avenue 
Columbus OH 43219 

 
  
Discover the Signature Series, the customized range of aircraft exclusive to NetJets. 
 
NetJets® Inc. is a Berkshire Hathaway Company. 
 

 
*** *** *** 
This message contains information which may be confidential and privileged. Unless you are the addressee (or 
authorized to receive for the addressee), you may not use, copy or disclose to anyone the message or any information 
contained in the message. If you have received the message in error,  please advise the sender by reply e‐mail and 
delete the message. 
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Slattery, Elizabeth (Federal)

From: NetJets Contracts - Central <Contracts.Central@netjets.com>
Sent: Monday, March 26, 2018 3:07 PM
To: hilary geary
Cc: Wilbur Ross; Leach, Macie (Federal); Gail Victor; NetJets Contracts - Central
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Fwd: NetJets Lease  

for Wilbur Ross

Thank you Hilary,  We have received the check.  I will send notice once we have closed   
 

Heather Griffith 
Contracts Administrator 
  
E. contracts.central@netjets.com 

T. 614-239-3675 

F. 614-239-6081 

netjets.com  
  

 
 

From: hilary geary [mailto:hilarygeary@me.com]  
Sent: Monday, March 26, 2018 9:04 AM 
To: NetJets Contracts ‐ Central <Contracts.Central@netjets.com> 
Cc: Wilbur Ross <wilburross@icloud.com>; Macie Leach <SLeach@doc.gov> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Fwd: NetJets Lease   for Wilbur 
Ross 
 

********************************  
This message originated from outside of NetJets. Please use caution when clicking on any links or attachments.  
********************************  

Hi   
Here is the tracking  

Sent from my iPhone  
Hilary Geary Ross 

 
 
 
Begin forwarded message: 

From: hilary geary < > 
Date: March 24, 2018 at 8:56:56 AM EDT 
To: Gail Victor <gvictor@netjets.com> 
Cc: Wilbur Ross < >, Macie Leach <SLeach@doc.gov> 
Subject: Re: NetJets Lease   for Wilbur 
Ross 
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Hi   
Have sent a FedEx and the tracking number is   should be there Monday morning 
Thanks  
All the best  

Hilary Geary Ross 
 

 
 
On Mar 23, 2018, at 7:16 PM, Gail Victor <gvictor@netjets.com> wrote: 

Dear Hilary  
Here you are. 
Best regards 
Gail Victor  

Sent from my iPhone 
 
Begin forwarded message: 

From: NetJets Contracts ‐ Central <Contracts.Central@netjets.com> 
Date: March 23, 2018 at 5:06:03 PM EDT 
To: " " < > 
Cc: Cory Valentine <cvalentine@netjets.com>, Gail Victor 
<gvictor@netjets.com>, NetJets Contracts ‐ Central 
<Contracts.Central@netjets.com> 
Subject: RE: NetJets Lease   

for Wilbur Ross 

Mr. Ross, 
  
At the request of your Sales Team, I am re‐sending the documents for 
the   
  
Best Regards, 
  

Heather Griffith 
Contracts Administrator 
  
E. contracts.central@netjets.com 

T. 614-239-3675 

F. 614-239-6081 

netjets.com  
  

 

**** **** **** ****  
This message contains information which may be confidential and privileged. Unless you 
are the addressee (or authorized to receive for the addressee), you may not use, copy or 
disclose to anyone the message or any information contained in the message. If you 
have received the message in error, please advise the sender by reply e‐mail and delete 
the message.  

<image001.png> 
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Discover the Signature Series, the customized range of aircraft exclusive 
to NetJets. 
  
NetJets® Inc. is a Berkshire Hathaway Company. 
  
  
  

< > 

 
*** *** *** 
This message contains information which may be confidential and privileged. Unless you are the addressee (or 
authorized to receive for the addressee), you may not use, copy or disclose to anyone the message or any information 
contained in the message. If you have received the message in error,  please advise the sender by reply e‐mail and 
delete the message. 
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Slattery, Elizabeth (Federal)

From: NetJets Contracts - Central <Contracts.Central@netjets.com>
Sent: Monday, March 26, 2018 8:58 AM
To: hilary geary
Cc: Gail Victor; Wilbur Ross; Leach, Macie (Federal); NetJets Contracts - Central
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Re: NetJets - Wilbur Ross

Great, Thank you!  I will let you know when we receive. 
 
Heather Griffith 
Contracts Administrator 
  
E. contracts.central@netjets.com 
T. 614‐239‐3675 
F. 614‐239‐6081 
netjets.com  
  
 
 
‐‐‐‐‐Original Message‐‐‐‐‐ 
From: hilary geary [mailto ] 
Sent: Monday, March 26, 2018 8:50 AM 
To: NetJets Contracts ‐ Central <Contracts.Central@netjets.com> 
Cc: Gail Victor <gvictor@netjets.com>; Wilbur Ross < >; Macie Leach <SLeach@doc.gov> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: NetJets ‐ Wilbur Ross 
 
******************************** 
This message originated from outside of NetJets. Please use caution when clicking on any links or attachments. 
******************************** 
 
Hi 
Have already FedExed a check that should arrive today Thanks! 
 
Sent from my iPhone 
Hilary Geary Ross 

 
 
 
> On Mar 26, 2018, at 8:41 AM, NetJets Contracts ‐ Central <Contracts.Central@netjets.com> wrote: 
> 
> Good Morning, 
> 
> I confirm receipt of the signature pages.  I have listed our wire instructions below for wiring the balance along with the 
address for sending a check if you prefer to do that instead.  Please confirm once the funds have been sent our way so 
we can look for them and confirm when received. 
> 
> Wire Instructions 
> 
>                
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> 
> 
> FedEx Address 
> 
> NetJets® Inc. 
> 4111 Bridgeway Avenue 
> 4th Floor ‐ Contracts Department 
> Columbus OH 43219 
> 
> Thank you, 
> 
> Heather Griffith 
> Contracts Administrator 
> 
> E. contracts.central@netjets.com 
> T. 614‐239‐3675 
> F. 614‐239‐6081 
> netjets.com 
> 
> 
> 
> ‐‐‐‐‐Original Message‐‐‐‐‐ 
> From: hilary geary [mailto ] 
> Sent: Friday, March 23, 2018 7:29 PM 
> To: hilarygeary@me.com; NetJets Contracts ‐ Central  
> <Contracts.Central@netjets.com>; Gail Victor <gvictor@netjets.com>;  
> Wilbur Ross < > 
> Subject: [EXTERNAL] [Tiny Scanner] Doc Mar 23, 2018, 19:24 
> 
> ******************************** 
> This message originated from outside of NetJets. Please use caution when clicking on any links or attachments. 
> ******************************** 
> 
> *** *** *** 
> This message contains information which may be confidential and privileged. Unless you are the addressee (or 
authorized to receive for the addressee), you may not use, copy or disclose to anyone the message or any information 
contained in the message. If you have received the message in error,  please advise the sender by reply e‐mail and 
delete the message. 
> 
 
*** *** *** 
This message contains information which may be confidential and privileged. Unless you are the addressee (or 
authorized to receive for the addressee), you may not use, copy or disclose to anyone the message or any information 
contained in the message. If you have received the message in error,  please advise the sender by reply e‐mail and 
delete the message. 
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Slattery, Elizabeth (Federal)

From: Leach, Macie (Federal)
Sent: Monday, March 19, 2018 4:49 PM
To: Bedan, Morgan (Federal); Neuhaus, Chelsey (Federal)
Subject: FW: Palm Beach Event March 22nd
Attachments: Tippins-PalmBeach3.22[4].pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

 
 

From: Prescott Miller [mailto ]  
Sent: Friday, March 16, 2018 3:34 PM 
To:  ; Ross, Wilbur (Federal) <WLRoss@doc.gov>;   
Subject: Palm Beach Event March 22nd 
 
Secretary and Mrs. Ross,  
I hope this email finds you well.  You may have received the attached invitation in the mail directly for Anne Summers but my 
father, Donald Miller, suggested I also send you a copy via email. Ann and Peter Summers are graciously hosting an event at 
their home on March 22nd for our friend Clay Tippins, Republican candidate for Governor of Georgia. If you are in town, I 
hope you will consider joining us. 
 
Clay is an exceptional individual and I think you will enjoy talking with him.    After 15 years in the private sector, most recently 
running a half billion dollar P&L for global consulting giant Capgemini, Clay has decided to apply his business turnaround skills 
to help the people of Georgia by running for Governor. As an All‐American swimmer at Stanford and retired Navy SEAL, Clay is 
no stranger to hard work and overcoming obstacles.  
 
Clay believes that every State needs smaller and smarter government. This means tackling a variety of tough issues such as 
reducing waste and abuse of entitlement programs and implementing new programs around education, modern 

transportation, crime and health care.  Clay’s proven transformative leadership skills and background as a 
corporate consultant, Navy SEAL and successful technology business executive, will enable him to 
deliver new policy methods and better results that are replicable across State lines.  
 
I know Clay would deeply appreciate the opportunity to gain your insight on a variety of issues.  Please let me know if you 
have any questions about Clay, the event or if I can help facilitate an introduction.  
Warmest Regards, 
Prescott Miller 
 
For more information on Clay please see his website, https://claytippins.com/.   
 
Managing Director 
Round Hill Capital LLC 
3050 Peachtree Rd, Suite 200 
Atlanta, GA 30305 
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